
                                                        

 

 

Free consultations with an   
Educational Psychologist 

 

If you want to book a consultation 
with an EP or you want more 
information, please send an email 
with your name and telephone 
number to 
familyadmin@markfield.org.uk 
stating if you prefer an in-person 
meeting or a telephone 
consultation. 

 

Educational psychologists (EPs) 
are qualified specialists who offer 
support and advice to schools, 
early years settings, voluntary 
groups, parents, carers, children 
and young people on a range of 
issues. This includes supporting 
children with disabilities, learning 
difficulties or social, emotional and 
mental health difficulties.  
 
For more information on EPs: 
https://www.haringey.gov.uk/childre
n-and-families/local-offer/5-15-year-
olds/educational-psychology-
service 

 

Where: Markfield community 
Centre, in Markfield Park, Markfield 
Road, London, N15 4RB 
(consultations are also available by 
telephone) 
 
When: Appointment slots are 
available once a month  

 

Are you worried about 
your child’s development, 
learning, emotional well-
being or behaviour?  
 
Then book a free 40 minute 
session with an educational 
psychologist from Haringey 
Educational Psychology Service.  
We can talk through your concerns 
with you, help you make a plan of 
action and signpost you to sources 
of help and support.  

 


